
F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 11-1176

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Purchase of Digital Sewer Inspection Camera, Ferrous Metal Detector

FOR: & Underground Pipe Locator

TIME &  

DATE: 3:00 p.m., November 10, 2011
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

 UNIT  

2 ea. PRICE 7,240.00 8,050.0

Camera System, Digital Sewer Inspection, per specifications TOTAL 14,480.00 No Bid 16,100.00 NO BID

1. Make and Model Quoting MAKE Metrotech Veam Metrotech Vcam

33 ea.  

Detector, Ferrous Metal Carbon Fiber reinforced antenna tube light weight 820.00 654.06 976.00

digital display, per specifications 27,060.00 21,583.98 32,208.00 NO BID

2. Make and Model Quoting Metrotech VM880 Rycom MS1M Metrotech VM-880

7 ea. 3,738.00 3,473.42 4,200.00 NO BID

3. Locator, underground pipe receiver, per specifications 26,166.00 24,313.94 29,400.00

Transmitter Metrotech vLoc Rycom 8879PLS Metrotech vLoc NO BID

Make and Model Quoting Pro 10 watt kit 10 watt Pro 10 watt

Net Net Net

 Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days

Delivery Days 30 days 30 days

   

*LOW BIDDER

BID INVITATIONS MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

ECA SSI Demandstar

EGW Utilities, Inc. SAWS Website

Indepth Utility Solutions, LLC

Kinloch Equipment Supply
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